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NOTICES – 5 April 2020 

 

LEAGUE OF LIGHT.  It's that time of the year again when holders of 

League of Light Boxes for Action for Children are asked to hand 

them to June Sperring, the local Action for Children Secretary, so 

that they can be emptied, the money counted and sent on to the 

Charity. Please let me have your box at the first opportunity so that 

I can forward the money to the Charity.  If you are wondering what 

this is about it probably means that you haven't yet got a box. I 

have a good supply of boxes for new subscribers and I'll be very 

happy to let you have your own brand new shiny box. 

 FAIRTRID TEA AND COFFEE.  Could any organisation requiring 

Fairtraid tea or coffee please contact Barbara Bennett who has 

kindly agreed to look after this for Beckminster as I shall be moving 

away from Wolverhampton in the not too distant future.    Rita 

Powell 

 

 

 

LENT BAGS.  These have not been forgotten in these difficult times. 
Charities will be in need as never before. Do keep filling them as 
you are able or put aside monies you have saved by not going out.  
We plan a thank you when the church meets again.  Keep safe and 
thank you for your support. 
 
SAM HAGERMAN’S ORDINATION.  Some may have heard the 
news that the Methodist Conference will not be happening in the 
form we expected this year – for very understandable reasons. 
Taking this decision obviously raises a long list of other questions. 
One of which is what happens about ordination services. The 
answer is that no decisions have yet been taken. We will let you 
know as soon as there is more news to share. In the meantime, I 
encourage us all to pray for Sam and her family in these anxious 
and unsettling times. Whatever the timing may be, Sam will be 
ordained (subject to Conference of course!) and we will continue to 
value her rich ministry among us. 
 
CHURCH ADMINISTRATION.  As I am working from home can you 

please send any emails to me on info@beckminsterchurch.co.uk  

and telephone me on 01902 761322.  Sue 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

http://www.beckminsterchurch.co.uk/
mailto:info@beckminsterchurch.co.uk


 

SAYING YES TO LIFE – Chapter 6.  We will meet again on Zoom to 
look at chapter 6 of our lent book “Saying Yes to Life”. You don’t 
need a copy of the book to join us and it will be great for you to join 
us. Here is the information to join us.  We are choosing to use the 
Zoom online platform because in most cases, you do not need to 
download any software in order to make use of it. From a PC or 
laptop, you should just be able to click the link below at the 
appointed start time.  If prompted to “Allow Join Meeting”  “Allow 
Video”  “Allow Audio” please answer “Yes”.  Join Zoom Meeting 
https://us04web.zoom.us/j/788269301?pwd=Mm5KOUNLSHpRNTF
ZcDdDcHVPOG5Ydz09   If you intend using a Smartphone then 
please download the Zoom.Us app and then click the above. You 
may need this meeting ID and Password: 

Meeting ID: 788 269 301 

Password: 687282 

Alternatively you can join on a phoneline.  You obviously won’t be 
able to see other people but you should both be able to hear and to 
be heard.   

Dial by your location 

        +44 330 088 5830 United Kingdom 

        +44 131 460 1196 United Kingdom 

        +44 203 481 5240 United Kingdom 

        +44 208 080 6591 United Kingdom 

        +44 208 080 6592 United Kingdom 

         

Meeting ID: 788 269 301 

Find your local number: https://us04web.zoom.us/u/fORXRRQHK 
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